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PRODUCT DATA SHEET 
Article No. 64.310.0 - Crosstwist Low  S3 HRO SRC

	Protection: 	 Fiberglass Toecap and flexible FAP® midsole
	 Plus: 	 injected protection in the toe area and heel area
	 Upper: 	 leather, microfibre & textile
	 Lining: 	 BreathActive functional lining
	 Footbed: 	 evercushion® BA
	 Sole: 	 rubber sole URBAN with ldCELL and Rotation Point
		  System, 300°C heat resistant
	Sizes / Width: 	39 - 47 / 11

EVA midsole
We injected billions of tiny bubbles in 
this ultra lightweight midsole for an 
optimal cushioning and an improved 
flexing action of the foot.

FiberglassCap
The new developed high tech fiber-
glass toe cap for optimized protec-
tion and enhanced flexibility.

idCell
The idCELL element in the heel area 
consists of a very soft sponge EVA 
midsole and perfectly absorbs im-
pacts and shocks when the heel 
strikes the ground.

Rubber outsole URBAN
This 300° C heat resistant HRO 
rubber outsole with its differently 
shaped profile elements offers op-
timal mobility and safe contact with 
the ground. Due to the increase of 
the rotation point, friction and thus 
tiredness can be significantly redu-
ced.

evercushion® BA
This anatomically designed footbed 
provides a high level of comfort and 
moisture control, giving a pleasant foot 
climate. This footbed, as used in high 
performance  sports shoes, is made 
from a soft, opencell, resilient foam 
that will not compress in wear, which 
assures a high level of cushioning, 
breathability and moisture regulation.

Upper
Areas to especially high wear are 
made of durable leather. The combi-
nation with resistant micro-fiber and 
textile inserts makes this upper par-
ticularly resilient and breathable.

HRO SOLESLIP RESISTANT

DGUV
112 - 191


